

Date	Name	Billed Amt	Bill Hrs	Narrative
9/10/2008	Miller, Harvey R.	\$570.00	0.6	T/Cs SJD 5x
9/10/2008	Miller, Harvey R.	\$190.00	0.2	T/C T. Russo - 1x
9/10/2008	Miller, Harvey R.	\$1,900.00	2	Team meetings - confidentiality, etc.
9/10/2008	Miller, Harvey R.	\$190.00	0.2	email Ronit Berkovich re: taces
9/11/2008	Miller, Harvey R.	\$380.00	0.4	T/Cs RPK & SYW re: process etc, 2x
9/11/2008	Miller, Harvey R.	\$380.00	0.4	T/Cs SJD re: status - 2x
9/11/2008	Miller, Harvey R.	\$380.00	0.4	CKonf. call TR, SK et al re: end game
9/11/2008	Miller, Harvey R.	\$190.00	0.2	T/C SJD re: TB & SB
9/11/2008	Miller, Harvey R.	\$570.00	0.6	Conf. - Team re: progress

Date	Name	Billed Amt	Bill Hrs	Narrative
9/12/2008	Miller, Harvey R.	\$2,850.00	3	T/Cs TR, MS, team - conference and review
9/12/2008	Miller, Harvey R.	\$1,900.00	2	Conf. at client - Fed, SEC, internal
9/12/2008	Miller, Harvey R.	\$570.00	0.6	Cofn. Tr, Jane re: inquiries
9/12/2008	Miller, Harvey R.	\$95.00	0.1	T/C TR re: BOD
9/12/2008	Miller, Harvey R.	\$950.00	1	Team meeting in preparation
9/12/2008	Miller, Harvey R.	\$380.00	0.4	Conf. SJD re: status
9/13/2008	Miller, Harvey R.	\$13,300.00	14	Lehman/Equinox - preparation for bankruptcy filings; T/Cs Tom Russo 5x; Steve Berkenfeld 2x; Mark Shapiro 5x; Tom Roberts 3x; SJD 15x; H. Novikoff 4x; Jane MacDonald 2x; LRF 2x; Elizabeth Lex 1x; Tom H., M. Francie, JW
9/14/2008	Miller, Harvey R.	\$16,150.00	17	Preparation for filings; conf. of Fed, SEC; --- Conf. W Fed - 33 Liberty Street --- conf. @ Leh. - BOD Meeting - Resolution --- Conf. with Ian Norwitz re: 1xst Day - -- conf. S. Berkenfeld- -- Conf @ WGM

Date	Name	Billed Amt	Bill Hrs	Narrative
9/10/2008	Krasnow, Richard P.	\$2,595.50	2.9	Conf with HRM, Weisman, J. Marcus, reviewed docs, team meeting, conf with Grogan.
9/11/2008	Krasnow, Richard P.	\$9,308.00	10.4	Conf calls with client, confs with HRM, confs with Marcus, Waisman, all re: strategy; t/c SJD; emails re: VEBA, meeting with limited group re: prep reviewed docs and miscell. related matters.
9/12/2008	Krasnow, Richard P.	\$8,323.50	9.3	Conf calls, confs reviewed docs all re: potential filing, liquidation issues, Newberger issues and miscell related matters.
9/13/2008	Krasnow, Richard P.	\$6,354.50	7.1	T/c's confs, reviewed docs, conf calls all re: potential filing.
9/14/2008	Krasnow, Richard P.	\$15,752.00	17.6	Prep for filing.

L.Fife

Date	Name	Billed Amt	Bill Hrs	Narrative
9/13/2008	Fife, Lori R.	\$14,190.00	16.5	Background Meeting; Prepare for Chapter 11 Filing; Participate in Meetings at Lehman; Review Pleadings.
9/14/2008	Fife, Lori R.	\$17,200.00	20	Meetings at Lehman re: Chapter 11 filing; Meeting at Federal Reserve Bank; Review and Revise Documents; Conference with Weil Team and Lehman re: Strategy; Board Meeting of Lehman for Filing.

Date	Name	Billed Amt	Bill Hrs	Narrative
9/10/2008	Waisman, Shai Y.	\$8,410.00	11.6	Meeting with Harvey and prepare for filing.
9/11/2008	Waisman, Shai Y.	\$9,715.00	13.4	Filing preparation.
9/12/2008	Waisman, Shai Y.	\$10,730.00	14.8	Contingency planning.
9/13/2008	Waisman, Shai Y.	\$12,687.50	17.5	Filing preparation.
9/14/2008	Waisman, Shai Y.	\$13,195.00	18.2	Filing preparation.

Date	Name	Billed Amt	Bill Hrs	Narrative
9/10/2008	Marcus, Jacqueline	\$3,773.00	4.9	Meeting with HRM, SYW, RPK regarding preparation for possible filing; team meeting regarding same; began review of relevant documents and 10-K.
9/11/2008	Marcus, Jacqueline	\$4,620.00	6	Office conference with Miller, Krasnow, Waisman (numerous); numerous telephone calls with Lehman regarding filing information; team meeting.
9/12/2008	Marcus, Jacqueline	\$4,081.00	5.3	Office conference with HRM, RPK, etc; reviewed pleadings; office conference with HRM, RPK, Dannhauser; telephone call with Lucas regarding additional information; office conference with Waisman; office conference with LRF, RPK, HRM regarding meeting with Fed.
9/13/2008	Marcus, Jacqueline	\$7,238.00	9.4	Meeting with HRM; reviewed first day pleadings; reviewed clearing agreements and memo regarding same.
9/14/2008	Marcus, Jacqueline	\$12,551.00	16.3	Participation in various conference call; reviewed petitions and other first day pleadings; reviewed Aurora servicing documents to determine if it needs to file a petition; office conference with HRM, LRF, SYW, RPK regarding results of meetings with Fed, board of directors; preparation for filing.

J.Grogan

Date	Name	Billed Amt	Bill Hrs	Narrative
9/10/2008	Grogan, James T.	\$3,159.00	5.4	Confer with Shai Waisman & Richard Krasnow regarding research on various statutes and legal issues, review documents (3.8); Attend meeting with Harvey Miller, Jackie Marcus, Richard Krasnow, Shai Waisman and John Lucas regarding case preparation (1.6).
9/11/2008	Grogan, James T.	\$8,892.00	15.2	Prepare first day affidavit and review client documents, and related data (6.2); Attend meeting regarding case status with Jackie Marcus, Shai Waisman and John Lucas (2.6); Begin draft first day motions, Confer with Jennifer Sapp and Amanda Hendy about same (2.8); Prepare checklist of various matters needed (1.5); Confer with Maurice Horwitz, Sunny Singh and Zaw Win regarding document preparation (1.4); Confer with John Lucas regarding case status (0.3); Attend meeting with Jackie Marcus and John Lucas regarding case status (0.4).
9/12/2008	Grogan, James T.	\$9,769.50	16.7	Attend meeting with Harvey Miller, Jackie Marcus and Shai Waisman regarding case status and strategy (1.5); Attend team meeting to discuss tasks needed for chapter 11 case, review related documents and prepare motions, affidavits and other pleadings(15.2).
9/13/2008	Grogan, James T.	\$10,705.50	18.3	Review documents related to chapter 11 case preparation, prepare motions, affidavits and other pleadings (18.3).
9/14/2008	Grogan, James T.	\$11,173.50	19.1	Draft, revise and finalize chapter 11 first day motions and orders; Review and exchange numerous emails with working group related to same; multiple conferences with working group related to same (19.1).

R.Berkovich

Date	Name	Billed Amt	Bill Hrs	Narrative
9/13/2008	Berkovich, Ronit J.	\$7,923.00	13.9	coordinate with team to prepare for chapter 11 filing of Lehman Brothers entities.
9/14/2008	Berkovich, Ronit J.	\$9,975.00	17.5	coordinate with team to prepare chapter 11 filing for Lehman Brothers Holdings Inc.

G. Fail

Date	Name	Billed Amt	Bill Hrs	Narrative
9/13/2008	Fail, Garrett	\$7,844.00	14.8	preparation for potential bankruptcy filing, including internal meetings and tcs and meetings at lehman brothers.
9/14/2008	Fail, Garrett	\$8,851.00	16.7	prepare for filing and file chapter 11 case, including team meetings and tcs and emails with lehman, obtaining relevant signatures, etc.

Date	Name	Billed Amt	Bill Hrs	Narrative
9/10/2008	Horwitz, Maurice	\$461.50	1.3	Attended meeting of initial case team.
9/10/2008	Horwitz, Maurice	\$71.00	0.2	Began preparing organizational chart of Lehman Brothers Holdings Inc. and its related entities based on information available in the Company's most recent 10-K.
9/10/2008	Horwitz, Maurice	\$1,881.50	5.3	Continued drawing organizational chart of Lehman Brothers Holdings Inc. and its related entities based on information available on the Company's most recent 10-K.
9/11/2008	Horwitz, Maurice	\$1,242.50	3.5	Continued drawing organizational chart of Lehman Brothers Holdings Inc. and its related entities based on information available on the Company's most recent 10-K.
9/11/2008	Horwitz, Maurice	\$2,307.50	6.5	Prepared chapter 11 petition for Lehman Brothers Holdings Inc., as well as petitions for all Company affiliates that need to be ready for filing.
9/11/2008	Horwitz, Maurice	\$710.00	2	Team meeting re case strategy, including which entities might benefit from a chapter 11 filing.
9/11/2008	Horwitz, Maurice	\$923.00	2.6	Continued preparing all petitions for Debtor's related entities, including searching company data sheets for pertinent information about the companies.
9/12/2008	Horwitz, Maurice	\$177.50	0.5	Revised petition task sheet.
9/12/2008	Horwitz, Maurice	\$71.00	0.2	Prepared Draft of DEBTOR'S MOTION PURSUANT TO SECTIONS 105(a), 362(d), 363(b) AND 503(b) OF THE BANKRUPTCY CODE AND BANKRUPTCY RULES 4001, 6003 AND 6004 SEEKING AUTHORITY TO (A) (i) CONTINUE THE DEBTOR'S WORKERS' COMPENSATION PROGRAMS AND ITS LIABILITY, PROPERTY, AND OTHER INSURANCE PROGRAMS AND (ii) PAY ALL PREPETITION OBLIGATIONS IN RESPECT THEREOF, (B) DIRECT FINANCIAL INSTITUTIONS TO HONOR AND PROCESS CHECKS AND TRANSFERS RELATED TO SUCH OBLIGATIONS AND (C) SCHEDULE A FINAL HEARING.

Date	Name	Billed Amt	Bill Hrs	Narrative
9/12/2008	Horwitz, Maurice	\$35.50	0.1	Prepared Draft of DEBTOR'S MOTION PURSUANT TO SECTIONS 105(a), 362(d), 363(b) AND 503(b) OF THE BANKRUPTCY CODE AND BANKRUPTCY RULES 4001, 6003 AND 6004 SEEKING AUTHORITY TO (A) (i) CONTINUE THE DEBTOR'S WORKERS' COMPENSATION PROGRAMS AND ITS LIABILITY, PROPERTY, AND OTHER INSURANCE PROGRAMS AND (ii) PAY ALL PREPETITION OBLIGATIONS IN RESPECT THEREOF, (B) DIRECT FINANCIAL INSTITUTIONS TO HONOR AND PROCESS CHECKS AND TRANSFERS RELATED TO SUCH OBLIGATIONS AND (C) SCHEDULE A FINAL HEARING.
9/12/2008	Horwitz, Maurice	\$958.50	2.7	Organized and prepared documents necessary to prepare company petitions and petitions themselves.
9/12/2008	Horwitz, Maurice	\$710.00	2	Revised motion to continue insurance and worker's compensation programs.
9/12/2008	Horwitz, Maurice	\$674.50	1.9	Prepared Draft of DEBTOR'S MOTION PURSUANT TO SECTIONS 105(a), 362(d), 363(b) AND 503(b) OF THE BANKRUPTCY CODE AND BANKRUPTCY RULES 4001, 6003 AND 6004 SEEKING AUTHORITY TO (A) (i) CONTINUE THE DEBTOR'S WORKERS' COMPENSATION PROGRAMS AND ITS LIABILITY, PROPERTY, AND OTHER INSURANCE PROGRAMS AND (ii) PAY ALL PREPETITION OBLIGATIONS IN RESPECT THEREOF, (B) DIRECT FINANCIAL INSTITUTIONS TO HONOR AND PROCESS CHECKS AND TRANSFERS RELATED TO SUCH OBLIGATIONS AND (C) SCHEDULE A FINAL HEARING.
9/12/2008	Horwitz, Maurice	\$497.00	1.4	Attended team meeting to prepare all first day motions and other administrative papers.
9/12/2008	Horwitz, Maurice	\$142.00	0.4	Drafted Lehman Brothers Holdings Inc. corporate ownership statement.
9/12/2008	Horwitz, Maurice	\$177.50	0.5	Drafted scheduling order for Lehman Brothers Holdings Inc.
9/13/2008	Horwitz, Maurice	\$213.00	0.6	Checked organizational charts and most recent 10-K to ensure accuracy of corporate ownership statement.
9/13/2008	Horwitz, Maurice	\$177.50	0.5	Key citing cases for motion to continue insurance and worker's compensation programs.

Date	Name	Billed Amt	Bill Hrs	Narrative
9/13/2008	Horwitz, Maurice	\$390.50	1.1	Attended meeting to discuss general case strategy and determine which entities should file petitions.
9/13/2008	Horwitz, Maurice	\$426.00	1.2	Redraft motion to continue insurance and worker's compensation programs based on additional information obtained from the company.
9/13/2008	Horwitz, Maurice	\$142.00	0.4	Revise task sheet and contact sheet to account for new team members and additional tasks.
9/13/2008	Horwitz, Maurice	\$426.00	1.2	Revised motion to continue insurance and worker's compensation programs.
9/13/2008	Horwitz, Maurice	\$142.00	0.4	Revised task sheet and team contact information.
9/13/2008	Horwitz, Maurice	\$532.50	1.5	Revised motion to continue insurance and worker's compensation programs.
9/13/2008	Horwitz, Maurice	\$106.50	0.3	Reviewed company's most recent 10-Q for more information on the company's corporate structure.
9/13/2008	Horwitz, Maurice	\$71.00	0.2	Revised motion to continue insurance and worker's compensation programs.
9/13/2008	Horwitz, Maurice	\$142.00	0.4	Reviewed company's most recent 10-Q for more information on company's corporate structure and ownership.
9/13/2008	Horwitz, Maurice	\$177.50	0.5	Printed and distributed copies of the Security Investor Protection Act.
9/13/2008	Horwitz, Maurice	\$248.50	0.7	Prepare chapter 11 petition for LB 745 LLC.
9/13/2008	Horwitz, Maurice	\$603.50	1.7	Revised corporate ownership statement for Lehman Brothers Holdings Inc.
9/13/2008	Horwitz, Maurice	\$461.50	1.3	Redraft motion to continue insurance and worker's compensation programs.
9/14/2008	Horwitz, Maurice	\$106.50	0.3	Prepared copies of all motions for partner review.
9/14/2008	Horwitz, Maurice	\$284.00	0.8	Revised investment guidelines to reflect consolidated filings.
9/14/2008	Horwitz, Maurice	\$2,556.00	7.2	Revised all petitions for entities that may file on Sunday night.

Date	Name	Billed Amt	Bill Hrs	Narrative
9/14/2008	Horwitz, Maurice	\$213.00	0.6	Review data sheets for entities formed as Limited Liability Corporations for drafting of corporate board resolutions.
9/14/2008	Horwitz, Maurice	\$284.00	0.8	Meeting with corporate to determine possibilities for the sale of Investment Management Division pursuant to 11 U.S.C. 366.
9/14/2008	Horwitz, Maurice	\$497.00	1.4	Companies and to Establish Procedures for Determining Requests for Additional Adequate Assurance.
9/14/2008	Horwitz, Maurice	\$142.00	0.4	Revise motion and order authorizing the continuation of cash management system and maintenance of existing bank accounts.

Date	Name	Billed Amt	Bill Hrs	Narrative
9/10/2008	Lucas, John W.	\$697.50	1.5	Equinox team meeting.
9/10/2008	Lucas, John W.	\$1,860.00	4	Draft DIP manual.
9/11/2008	Lucas, John W.	\$6,231.00	13.4	Meetings with company regarding business entity information; team meetings regarding preparations; prepare first day motions and other pleadings; review the same from team.
9/12/2008	Lucas, John W.	\$6,510.00	14	Draft questionnaires for company; draft first day pleadings; review and review first day pleadings; meeting with team regarding the same.
9/13/2008	Lucas, John W.	\$7,440.00	16	Draft first day pleadings; review first day pleadings; various meetings with team and individual members regarding the project.
9/14/2008	Lucas, John W.	\$7,440.00	16	Draft first day pleadings; review first day pleadings; various meetings with team and individual members regarding the project.

Date	Name	Billed Amt	Bill Hrs	Narrative
9/11/2008	Sapp, Jennifer	\$1,633.00	4.6	Drafting Motion for Joint Administration; drafting motion of waiver to file creditor list.
9/11/2008	Sapp, Jennifer	\$213.00	0.6	Meeting with James Grogan re: assignments and what first day pleadings to begin drafting and revision of drafts.
9/11/2008	Sapp, Jennifer	\$426.00	1.2	Working dinner discussed strategy and pleadings.
9/11/2008	Sapp, Jennifer	\$852.00	2.4	Read May 2008 10Q; Feb. 2008 10Q and Nov. 2007 10k. Began drafting schedules for first day pleadings.
9/12/2008	Sapp, Jennifer	\$319.50	0.9	Drafted application to employ debtor counsel.
9/12/2008	Sapp, Jennifer	\$497.00	1.4	Team meeting to discuss strategy and assignments.
9/12/2008	Sapp, Jennifer	\$2,449.50	6.9	Drafted and edited motion fore waiver of creditor list and establishing notice commencement.
9/12/2008	Sapp, Jennifer	\$639.00	1.8	Drafted and edited motion for application to retain claims and noticing agent.
9/12/2008	Sapp, Jennifer	\$745.50	2.1	Drafting Motion for Joint Administration; drafting motion of waiver to file creditor list.
9/13/2008	Sapp, Jennifer	\$1,881.50	5.3	Draft and edited motion for Waiver of First Day Affidavit Requirement.
9/13/2008	Sapp, Jennifer	\$497.00	1.4	Meeting with team to discuss strategy and assignments.
9/13/2008	Sapp, Jennifer	\$1,207.00	3.4	Drafted and edited application to retain claims and noticing agent.
9/13/2008	Sapp, Jennifer	\$1,065.00	3	Edited motion for waiver of creditor list and establishing notice of commencement.
9/14/2008	Sapp, Jennifer	\$284.00	0.8	Edited motion to waive first day affidavit requirements
9/14/2008	Sapp, Jennifer	\$213.00	0.6	researching creditors
9/14/2008	Sapp, Jennifer	\$2,236.50	6.3	Updating all pleadings provision; and edits.
9/14/2008	Sapp, Jennifer	\$35.50	0.1	Updated all pleadings with new notice provision.
9/14/2008	Sapp, Jennifer	\$319.50	0.9	Strategy meeting.

Date	Name	Billed Amt	Bill Hrs	Narrative
9/14/2008	Sapp, Jennifer	\$852.00	2.4	Drafted and edited motion for waiver of creditor list and establishing notice of commencement.
9/14/2008	Sapp, Jennifer	\$71.00	0.2	Drafted and edited joint administration motion.
9/14/2008	Sapp, Jennifer	\$674.50	1.9	Drafted and edited application for claims and noticing agent.
9/14/2008	Sapp, Jennifer	\$958.50	2.7	Updating task list.
9/14/2008	Sapp, Jennifer	\$248.50	0.7	Drafted and edited Notice of First Day Motions

Date	Name	Billed Amt	Bill Hrs	Narrative
9/10/2008	Singh, Sunny	\$415.00	1	Locate Finlay Jewlers board resolution on fiduciary duties and Delaware Supreme Court opinion in Gheewala for S. Waisman.
9/10/2008	Singh, Sunny	\$1,369.50	3.3	Create excel sheet detailing all entities, their jurisdiction of organization, eligibility to file for relief and potential issues or concerns in connection with filing for chapter 11.
9/11/2008	Singh, Sunny	\$415.00	1	Team meeting to discuss filing petitions. Receive and review form for petitions and coordinate tasks.
9/11/2008	Singh, Sunny	\$415.00	1	Review and finalize debtor eligibility chart for team meeting.
9/11/2008	Singh, Sunny	\$332.00	0.8	At request of J. Marcus, research whether Neuberger Berman, Inc. is a registered broker and whether there are particular issues with respect to its eligibility to file.
9/11/2008	Singh, Sunny	\$954.50	2.3	Prepare approximately 30 petitions with M. Horwitz and Z. Win for filing.
9/11/2008	Singh, Sunny	\$830.00	2	Team meeting regarding status of case and potential issues. Discuss potential first days motions that may be needed and assign tasks.
9/11/2008	Singh, Sunny	\$1,245.00	3	Retrieve data sheets of companies that may be filing. Supplement petitions with such information.
9/11/2008	Singh, Sunny	\$1,245.00	3	Worked on researching information on all entities, location and potential issues relating to eligibility to file for relief and filling in chart.
9/12/2008	Singh, Sunny	\$415.00	1	Create reference list of petitions being drafted and document numbers.
9/12/2008	Singh, Sunny	\$954.50	2.3	Revise and review petitions. Create folders with petitions and data sheets for team meeting with Z. Win and M. Horwitz.
9/12/2008	Singh, Sunny	\$830.00	2	Begin working on pre-petition wage motion. Retrieve prior motions used for reference.
9/12/2008	Singh, Sunny	\$415.00	1	Team meeting regarding status update on petitions, first day motions, and related issues.
9/12/2008	Singh, Sunny	\$996.00	2.4	Work on drafting pre-petition wage motion.
9/12/2008	Singh, Sunny	\$249.00	0.6	Review company public filings and research company information needed for exhibit A.

Date	Name	Billed Amt	Bill Hrs	Narrative
9/13/2008	Singh, Sunny	\$954.50	2.3	Draft sales and use tax motion.
9/13/2008	Singh, Sunny	\$2,075.00	5	Continue to work on drafting employee wage motion.
9/13/2008	Singh, Sunny	\$1,245.00	3	Prepare outline for J. Lucas on types of employment programs that the company may have and highlight potential issues.
9/13/2008	Singh, Sunny	\$207.50	0.5	Insert corrections made by L. Lucas on sales and use tax motion.
9/14/2008	Singh, Sunny	\$539.50	1.3	Draft further revisions to Sales and Use tax motion and finalize. Call with John Derosa regarding outstanding sales and use taxes and general description of what is included.
9/14/2008	Singh, Sunny	\$1,909.00	4.6	Research set off and recoupment issues and update memo as per R. Berkovich's instructions.
9/14/2008	Singh, Sunny	\$954.50	2.3	discuss mark up of employee wage motion with D. Fail and insert corrections and revisions. Contact Paul Imbimbo and obtain information necessary for motion.
9/14/2008	Singh, Sunny	\$1,245.00	3	Assist team in finalizing first day motions. Review and revise employee wages, sales and use, extension of time to file schedules.
9/15/2008	Singh, Sunny	\$290.50	0.7	Phone conversations with multiple parties regarding status of bankruptcy case, information requests, potential purchasers interested in assets. Enter data onto call order log. Research court docket to provide information.
9/15/2008	Singh, Sunny	\$1,037.50	2.5	Revised draft of setoff and recoupment memo for R. Berkovich. Researched additional cases with respect to mutuality requirements and setoff.

Z.Win

Date	Name	Billed Amt	Bill Hrs	Narrative
9/10/2008	Win, Zaw	\$177.50	0.5	initial assignment meeting
9/10/2008	Win, Zaw	\$1,952.50	5.5	Prepared organizational chart describing client's corporate structure.
9/11/2008	Win, Zaw	\$106.50	0.3	complied missing facts list
9/11/2008	Win, Zaw	\$710.00	2	printed company info sheets and put together entity files
9/11/2008	Win, Zaw	\$106.50	0.3	meeting with John Lucas to get new assignment
9/11/2008	Win, Zaw	\$213.00	0.6	drafted board resolutions
9/11/2008	Win, Zaw	\$1,988.00	5.6	drafted motion to implement investment guidelines and board resolutions and revised Holdings petition
9/12/2008	Win, Zaw	\$426.00	1.2	prepared organizational chart
9/12/2008	Win, Zaw	\$1,065.00	3	revised organizational chart
9/12/2008	Win, Zaw	\$1,171.50	3.3	developed petitions for equinox entities
9/12/2008	Win, Zaw	\$1,242.50	3.5	drafted board resolutions
9/12/2008	Win, Zaw	\$710.00	2	strategy meeting
9/12/2008	Win, Zaw	\$1,136.00	3.2	updated petitions for equinox entities and drafted missing info list
9/13/2008	Win, Zaw	\$2,556.00	7.2	revised and populated petitions and attachments for holdings, aurora, LB 745 LLC, LB 745 Lease Co., created a petition for LB 745 Leaseco II LLC, and went to kinkos to print power point presentation.

Z.Win

Date	Name	Billed Amt	Bill Hrs	Narrative
9/13/2008	Win, Zaw	\$355.00	1	drafted attachments to holdings petition
9/13/2008	Win, Zaw	\$248.50	0.7	revised investment guideline motion
9/13/2008	Win, Zaw	\$177.50	0.5	merged holdings petition
9/13/2008	Win, Zaw	\$355.00	1	drafted sales and use tax memo.
9/13/2008	Win, Zaw	\$1,881.50	5.3	Formatted and printed skeleton petitions and company fact sheets for all of equinox's U.S. entities.
9/14/2008	Win, Zaw	\$1,704.00	4.8	revised petitions
9/14/2008	Win, Zaw	\$781.00	2.2	created and revised corp. ownership statements
9/14/2008	Win, Zaw	\$248.50	0.7	drafted comfort letter regarding the automatic stay
9/14/2008	Win, Zaw	\$461.50	1.3	helped create the top 30 creditors list
9/14/2008	Win, Zaw	\$816.50	2.3	drafted automatic stay motion and order