
From: Lukas, Katherine [CMB-GTS] [0000129179@citigroup.com] 
Sent: Friday, September 12, 2008 12:52 PM 
To: Deukmedjian, Chris [CMB-GTS]; Mauerstein, Michael [CMB-GBKG] 
Subject: FW: Did the remainder of the Lehman Deposit get released? 

The extra 1.8bn that was on deposit w/eddie is being released back to Lehman now -----Original Message----­
From: Hewett Jr, Edward A [CMB-FICC] 
Sent: Friday, September 12, 2008 12:51 PM 
To: Lukas, Katherine [CMB-GTS] 
Subject: RE: Did the remainder of the Lehman Deposit get released? 

releasing it now 

-----Original Message-----
From: Lukas, Katherine [CMB-GTS] 
Sent: Friday, September 12, 2008 12:50 PM 
To: Hewett Jr, Edward A [CMB-FICC] 
Subject: Did the remainder of the Lehman Deposit get released? 
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